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The Regional Resource Centre for Elementary Education (RRCEE) is offering two internship 
positions during the summer of 2015. The internships will provide an opportunity for college 
students to engage with issues in elementary education.  
 
The interns will engage in the activities of the Centre, pursue research, attend lectures and seminars, 
and to interact with academicians and teachers. In 2015, RRCEE will have two distinct internship 
positions: a) Media Intern and b) Research Intern. The Media Intern will be working closely on 
RRCEE’s website and podcast series on education. The Research Intern will be involved in 
supporting the activities of the Centre and pursuing research in a specific area concerning elementary 
education.  
 
Who is Eligible? 
Applications are open to students (both graduate and post graduate) and recent graduates.  Applicants 
with courses in Education or other social science disciplines will be preferred. Proficiency in English 
and working knowledge of word processing software(s) and computers is expected.  
 
Duration 
The duration for the summer internship is typically a month or two. This is usually discussed with 
the Interns depending on their college leave and other aspects. However, the minimum duration is 
one month, starting May 2015. 
 
Stipend 
The Centre does not provide a stipend for interns. Also, interns are expected to make their own 
arrangements for travel & accommodation in Delhi. 
 
Apply 
To apply, send in your latest CV to Vivek Vellanki at vivek@rrcee.net along with a statement of 
purpose indicating your preference (Media or Research) in less than 500 words. Please send in your 
applications latest by Wednesday, 6 May 2015.   
 
About RRCEE 
The Regional Resource Centre for Elementary Education (RRCEE) is based on the vision of creating 
spaces and mechanisms that connect teachers and teacher education institutes with spaces of higher 
learning. RRCEE aims at breaking the traditional isolation of teachers from centres of higher 
learning and the intellectual isolation of teachers. Viewing teachers as intellectuals and agents of 
change, the Centre provides teachers the opportunity to generate knowledge and be involved in a 
reflective practice that locates education within the larger social and cultural context. RRCEE 
provides several platforms for the professional development of teacher practitioners via its Summer 
Teacher Fellowship Programme, Library, Web-Portal, Public Lecture and Film Series, Podcast 
series, and other forums for elementary school teachers.  
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